2010 ANNUAL BID

ASPHALT CONCRETE OVERLAY PROJECT AC 2010-1

March 8, 2010 2:00 PM
Deerfield Road

Bituminous Paving, Inc.

P.O. Box 6

Ortonville, MN 56278

(320) 273-2113

Hills Materials Company

P.O. Box 2320

Rapid City, SD 57709

(605) 394-3300

J & J Asphalt Company

P.O. Box 7105

Rapid City, SD 57709

(605) 341-6262

Simon Contractors of SD, Inc.

P.O. Box 397

Rapid City, SD 57709

(605) 342-3734

Bid Bond: Yes Bid Bond: Yes Bid Bond: Yes Bid Bond: Yes
ITEM
NO. DESCRIPTION UNIT [ QUANTITY] UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL
1 Mobilization LS 1 $37,000.00 $37,000.00 | $16,000.00 $16,000.00 | $26,000.00 $26,000.00 $8,600.00 $8,600.00
2 Cold Milling Asphalt Concrete SY 66,900 $0.80 $53,520.00 $0.90 $60,210.00 $0.55 $36,795.00 $0.90 $60,210.00
3 |tack SS1H or CSS1H Ton 18.86 $625.00 $11,787.50 $800.00 $15,088.00 $800.00 $15,088.00 $925.00 $17,445.50
4 Asphalt Concrete Composite Ton 8,706 $84.00 | $731,304.00 $72.25 | $629,008.50 $73.05 $635,973.30 $80.25 $698,656.50
5 |1raffic Control Units 816 $1.00 $816.00 $0.52 $424.32 $3.20 $2,611.20 $2.35 $1,917.60
6 Flagging Hours 240 $25.00 $6,000.00 $24.40 $5,856.00 $20.00 $4,800.00 $32.00 $7,680.00
! Pilot Car Hours 120 $35.00 $4,200.00 $40.00 $4,800.00 $35.00 $4,200.00 $40.00 $4,800.00
8 Temporary Pavement Marking | Miles 9.24 $700.00 $6,468.00 $640.00 $5,913.60 $635.00 $5,867.40 $650.00 $6,006.00
° Pavement Marking Paint Yellow | Gal 150 $6.00 $900.00 $5.10 $765.00 $5.00 $750.00 $5.25 $787.50
10 Pavement Marking Paint White Gal 166 $6.00 $996.00 $5.10 $846.60 $5.00 $830.00 $5.25 $871.50
Total Bid $852,991.50 $738,912.02 $732,914.90 $806,974.60




2010 ANNUAL BID
ASPHALT CONCRETE OVERLAY PROJECT AC 2010-Z
March 8, 2010 2:00 PM
Pink Cabin Road

Bituminous Paving, Inc.

P.O. Box 6

Ortonville, MN 56278

(320) 273-2113

Hills Materials Company

P.O. Box 2320

Rapid City, SD 57709

(605) 390-0074

J & J Asphalt Company

P.O. Box 7105

Rapid City, SD 57709

(605) 341-6262

Simon Contractors of SD, Inc.

P.O. Box 397

Rapid City, SD 57709

(605) 342-3734

Bid Bond: Yes Bid Bond: Yes Bid Bond: Yes Bid Bond: Yes
TEM
NO. DESCRIPTION uniT | QUANTITY] UNITPRICE|  TOTAL | UNITPRICE|  TOTAL | UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL
1 |Mobilization Ls 1 $10,000.00 |  $10,000.00 |  $4,200.00 $4,200.00 |  $4,500.00 $4,500.00 |  $6,000.00 $6,000.00
2 |Tack SS1H or CSSIH Ton | 015 $625.00 $93.75 |  $4,900.00 $735.00 |  $3,000.00 $450.00 |  $2,500.00 $375.00
3 |Asphalt Concrete Composite | +,, | 191250 $89.00 | $170,212.50 $71.00 | $135,787.50 $70.00 |  $133,875.00 $76.00 $145,350.00
4 |Traffic Control Units | 387 $5.00 $1,935.00 $4.00 $1,548.00 $4.00 $1,548.00 $4.50 $1,741.50
5 Flagging
Hours| 60 $2500 |  $1,500.00 $23.90 | $1,434.00 $20.00 $1,200.00 $28.00 $1,680.00
6 Pilot Car
Hours| 30 $35.00 |  $1,050.00 $39.50 | $1,185.00 $35.00 $1,050.00 $38.00 $1,140.00
7 Temporary Marking Paint
Yellow Gal | 412 $30.00 |  $1,236.00 $2560 |  $1,054.72 $25.00 $1,030.00 $26.00 $1,071.20
8  |Temporary Marking Paint White | 41.2 $30.00 $1,236.00 $25.60 $1,054.72 $25.00 $1,030.00 $26.00 $1,071.20
Total Bid $187,263.25 $146,998.94 $144,683.00 $158,428.90




2010 ANNUAL BID
ASPHALT CONCRETE OVERLAY PROJECT AC 2010-3
March 8, 2010 2:00 PM
Bombing Range Road

Bituminous Paving, Inc.

P.O. Box 6

Ortonville, MN 56278

(320) 273-2113

Hills Materials Company

P.O. Box 2320

Rapid City, SD 57709

(605) 394-3300

Simon Contractors of SD, Inc.

P.O. Box 397

Rapid City, SD 57709

(605) 342-3734

Bid Bond: Yes Bid Bond: Yes Bid Bond: Yes
TEM
NO. DESCRIPTION UNIT |QUANTITY| UNITPRICE|  TOTAL | UNITPRICE|  TOTAL | UNIT PRICE TOTAL
1 [Mobilization LS 1 $11,000.00 | $11,000.00 | $4,800.00 $4,800.00 | $5,000.00 $5,000.00
2 [Tack SS1H or CSS1H Ton | 6.84 $625.00 |  $4,275.00 $970.00 | $6.634.80 | $1,000.00 $6,840.00
3 [Asphalt Concrete Composite | 1, | 36213 $70.00 | $253,491.00 $70.50 | $255,301.65 $83.10 |  $300,930.03
4 [Traffic Control Units | 387 $6.00 | $2,322.00 $4.40 | $1,702.80 $7.00 $2,709.00
5 [Flagging Hours 60 $25.00 $1,500.00 $23.90 $1,434.00 $37.60 $2,256.00
6  [Pilot Car Hours| 30 $35.00 |  $1,050.00 $39.50 | $1,185.00 $46.50 $1,395.00
7 Temporary Marking Paint
Yellow Gal | 3942 $30.00 |  $1,182.60 $25.60 |  $1,000.15 $27.50 $1,084.05
8  |Temporary Marking Paint White | ., | 7g g4 $30.00 $2,365.20 $25.60 $2,018.30 $27.50 $2,168.10
Total Bid $277,185.80 $274,085.70 $322,382.18




2010 ANNUAL BID

AGGREGATE STOCKPILE PROJECT AGG 2010-4

March 8, 2010 2:00 PM
Creston Area

Aggregate Construction, Inc.
P.O. Box 239
Minot, ND 58701
(701) 852-2343
Bid Bond:

Bob Bak Construction
P.O. Box 159

Pierre, SD 57501
(605) 223-3126

Western Construction, Inc.
P.O. Box 771

Rapid City, SD 57709
(605) 381-7634

Yes Bid Bond: Yes Bid Bond: Yes
ITEM
NO. ROAD NAME UNIT QTY UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL
1 Stockpiled Aggregate 3/4"
Gravel Creston Area Ton 40,000 $3.05 $122,000.00 $4.23 $169,200.00 $2.94 $117,600.00
Total Bid $122,000.00 $169,200.00 $117,600.00




2010 ANNUAL BID

AGGREGATE STOCKPILE PROJECT AGG 2010-5

March 8, 2010 2:00 PM
Copper Mt. and Nichols Creek

Aggregate Construction,
Inc.

P.O. Box 239

Minot, ND 58701

(701) 852-2343

Fisher Sand & Gravel
Company

P.O. Box 1120
Spearfish, SD 57783
(605) 642-5760

Frost Rock Products

P.O. Box 426
Lovell, WY 82431
(307) 548-6505

Hills Materials Company

P.O. Box 2320
Rapid City, SD 57709
(605) 394-3300

KD Contractors, Inc.

P.O. Box 870
Hot Springs, SD 57747
(605) 745-7087

Western Construction, Inc.

P.O. Box 771
Rapid City, SD 57709
(605) 381-7634

Bid Bond: Yes Bid Bond: Yes Bid Bond: Yes Bid Bond: Yes Bid Bond: Yes Bid Bond: Yes
ITEM UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT
NO. ROAD NAME UNIT QTY PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL
Stockpiled Aggregate 3/4"
1 |Gravel Surfacing Nichols
Creek Pit Ton 20,000 $5.38 [ $107,600.00 $7.50 [ $150,000.00 $7.30 [ $146,000.00 $5.05 [ $101,000.00 $4.75 $95,000.00 $5.75 | $115,000.00
Stockpiled Aggregate 3/4"
2 |Gravel Surfacing Copper
Mountain Pit Ton 20,000 $6.05 [  $121,000.00 $7.50 [ $150,000.00 $7.30 [ $146,000.00 $5.05 [  $101,000.00 $4.75 $95,000.00 $5.60 [ $112,000.00
Stockpiled Aggregate FS
3 |Grading V Nichols Creek
Pit Ton 5,000 $5.38 $26,900.00 |  $10.00 $50,000.00 $7.90 $39,500.00 $5.05 $25,250.00 $5.29 $26,450.00 $5.85 $29,250.00
Stockpiled Aggregate FS
4 |Grading V Copper
Mountain Pit Ton 5,000 $6.05 $30,250.00 |  $10.00 $50,000.00 $7.90 $39,500.00 $5.05 $25,250.00 $5.29 $26,450.00 $5.85 $29,250.00
5 [|Filler Material cy 1,000 $4.50 $4,500.00 $3.50 $3,500.00 |  $69.00 $69,000.00 |  $15.00 $15,000.00 $2.00 $2,000.00 $2.80 $2,800.00
) ) CY
6  |Filler Material Haul Mile 4,400 $1.00 $4,400.00 $0.30 $1,320.00 $6.00 $26,400.00 $1.35 $5,940.00 $0.99 $4,356.00 $0.47 $2,068.00
Total Bid $294,650.00 $404,820.00 $466,400.00 $273,440.00 $249,256.00 $290,368.00




2010 ANNUAL BID
ASPHALT SURFACE TREATMENT
March 8, 2010 2:00 PM

Bituminous Paving, Inc.

P.O. Box 6

Ortonville, MN 56278

(320) 273-2113

Hills Materials Company

P.O. Box 2320

Rapid City, SD 57709

(605) 394-3300

Jensen Rock and Sand, Inc.
P.O. Box 609

Mobridge, SD 57601

(605) 845-7213

Simon Constractors of SD, Inc.

P.O. Box 397

Rapid City, SD 57709

(605) 342-3734

Bid Bond: Yes Bid Bond: Yes Bid Bond: Yes Bid Bond: Yes
ITEM
NO. DESCRIPTION UNIT | QUANTITY] UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL
1 Mobilization
LS 1 $32,000.00 $32,000.00 | $25,000.00 $25,000.00 | $48,005.00 $48,005.00 | $39,000.00 $39,000.00
Asphalt for Surface Treatment
2 AE150S
Ton 477.64 $547.00 | $261,269.08 $560.00 | $267,478.40 $539.05 $257,471.84 $650.00 $310,466.00
3 Cover Aggregate for Surface
Treatment Type 2A Ton | 4130.99 $31.20 | $128,886.89 $35.00 | $144,584.65 $31.71 | $130,993.69 $41.00 $169,370.59
Asphalt for Fog Seal SS-1H or
4 CSS-1H
Ton 52.86 $750.00 $39,645.00 $1,025.00 $54,181.50 $829.14 $43,828.34 $975.00 $51,538.50
5 Temporary Pavement Marking
Mile 24.93 $610.00 $15,207.30 $565.00 $14,085.45 $550.00 $13,711.50 $650.00 $16,204.50
Loose Gravel Signs (W8-7) with
6 35 MPH Speed Plates (W13-1
18" X 18") Each 11 $60.00 $660.00 $51.30 $564.30 $50.00 $550.00 $55.00 $605.00
Total Bid $477,668.27 $505,894.30 $494,560.37 $587,184.59




2010 ANNUAL BID

ASPHALT SURFACE CRACK SEALING

March 8, 2010 2:00 PM

Highway Improvement, Inc,

P.O. Box 1803
Sioux Falls, SD 57101
(605) 310-7725

J & J Asphalt Company
P.O. Box 7105

Rapid City, SD 57709
(605) 341-6262

Roadway Services, Inc.
P.O. Box 1452

Fargo, ND 58107
(701) 293-1555

Simon Contractors of SD, Inc.
P.O. Box 397

Rapid City, SD 57709

(605) 342-3734

Bid Bond: Yes Bid Bond: Yes Bid Bond: Yes Bid Bond: Yes
ITEM UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT
NO. ROAD NAME UNIT| QTY PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL
1 221801 Bennett Road LF 1,000 $0.58 $580.00 $0.74 $740.00 $0.64 $640.00 $1.10 $1,100.00
1 221402 Country Road LF 8,000 $0.58 $4,640.00 $0.74 $5,920.00 $0.64 $5,120.00 $1.10 $8,800.00
2 126001 Deadwood Ave LF 3,000 $0.58 $1,740.00 $0.74 $2,220.00 $0.64 $1,920.00 $1.10 $3,300.00
3 150803 Creighton Road LF 15,000 $0.58 $8,700.00 $0.74] $11,100.00 $0.64 $9,600.00 $0.95 $14,250.00
4 151302 Quinn Road LF 11,000 $0.58 $6,380.00 $0.74 $8,140.00 $0.64 $7,040.00 $0.95 $10,450.00
5 159001 Sage Creek Road LF | 20,000 $0.58| $11,600.00 $0.74] $14,800.00 $0.63| $12,600.00 $0.95 $19,000.00
Total Bid $33,640.00 $42,920.00 $36,920.00 $56,900.00




2010 ANNUAL BID

AGGREGATE MATERIALS-RAPID CITY AREA

March 8, 2010 2:00 PM

Hills Materials Company
P.O. Box 2320

Rapid City, SD 57709
(605) 394-3300

J & L Gravel, Inc.

24045 Twin Springs Road
Hill City, SD 57745

(605) 574-2155

P.O. Box 440

(605) 342-7224

Pete Lien & Sons, Inc.

Rapid City, SD 57709

ITEM UNIT UNIT UNIT
NO. DESCRIPTION LOCATION UNIT PRICE LOCATION UNIT PRICE LOCATION UNIT PRICE
! 3 Inch Ballast (Limestone) Rapid City Quarry Ton $9.60]Perli Pit Quarry Ton $9.50]Rapid City Quarry Ton $8.25
2 1 Inch Base Course Aggregate Material Rapid City Quarry Ton $8.10]Perli Pit Quarry Ton $7.00]Rapid City Quarry Ton $7.20
3 Type 2A (3/8 Inch) Bituminous Surface
Treatment Aggregate Material Rapid City Quarry Ton $16.75|Perli Pit Quarry Ton No Bid]Rapid City Quarry Ton $12.35
4 Type 2A (3/8 Inch Modified) Bituminous
Surface Treatment Aggregate Material |Rapid City Quarry Ton $16.75|Perli Pit Quarry Ton No Bid|JRapid City Quarry Ton No Bid]
5 3/4 Inch Gravel Cushion Aggregate
Material Rapid City Quarry Ton $8.10]Perli Pit Quarry Ton $7.00]Rapid City Quarry Ton $7.20
6 3/4 Inch Gravel Surfacing Aggregate
Material Rapid City Quarry Ton $8.10]Perli Pit Quarry Ton $7.00]Rapid City Quarry Ton No Bid|
7 [Haul To 5 Miles Ton-Mile $1.35]To 5 Miles Ton-Mile No Bid]To 5 Miles Ton-Mile $0.60
8 [Haul 5 to 15 miles Ton-Mile $1.05]5 to 15 miles Ton-Mile No Bid|5 to 15 miles Ton-Mile $0.40
9 [Haul 15 or more miles | Ton-Mile $0.90]15 or more miles | Ton-Mile No Bid|15 or more miles | Ton-Mile $0.20




2010 ANNUAL BID
AGGREGATE MATERIALS-CRESTON AREA
March 8, 2010 2:00 PM

Hills Materials Company

P.O. Box 2320

Rapid City, SD 57709

(605) 394-3300

Pete Lien & Sons, Inc.

P.O. Box 440

Rapid City, SD 57709

(605) 342-7224

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION LOCATION UNIT UNIT PRICE LOCATION UNIT UNIT PRICE

10 1 Inch Base Course Aggregate

Material Creston Ton No Bid Creston Ton No Bid

Type 2A (3/8 Inch) Bituminous
11 Isurface Treatment A te Material

urface Treaiment Aggregate Materiallcragton Ton No Bid |Creston Ton No Bid

Type 2A (3/8 Inch Modified)
12 Bituminous Surface Treatment

Aggregate Material Creston Ton No Bid Creston Ton No Bid
13 3/4 Inch Gravel Cushion Aggregate

Material Creston Ton No Bid Creston Ton No Bid
14 3/4 Inch Gravel Surfacing Aggregate

Material Creston Ton No Bid Creston Ton No Bid
15 Haul To 5 Miles Ton-Mile No Bid To 5 Miles Ton-Mile No Bid
16 Haul 5to 15 miles Ton-Mile No Bid 5to 15 miles Ton-Mile No Bid
17 Haul 15 or more miles Ton-Mile No Bid 15 or more miles Ton-Mile No Bid

No bids received.




2010 ANNUAL BID

AGGREGATE MATERIALS-WASTA AREA

March 8, 2010 2:00 PM

P.O. Box 159
Pierre, SD 57501
(605) 223-3126

Bob Bak Construction

Hills Materials Company
P.O. Box 2320

Rapid City, SD 57709
(605) 394-3300

Pete Lien & Sons, Inc.

P.O. Box 440

Rapid City, SD 57709

(605) 342-7224

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION LOCATION UNIT UNIT PRICE LOCATION UNIT UNIT PRICE LOCATION UNIT UNIT PRICE

18 1 Inch Base Course Aggregate

Material \Wasta Ton No Bid Wasta Ton No Bid Wasta Ton No Bid

Type 2A (3/8 Inch) Bituminous
19 Surface Treatment Aggregate

Material Wasta Ton No Bid Wasta Ton No Bid Wasta Ton No Bid

Type 2A (3/8 Inch Modified)
20 Bituminous Surface Treatment

Aggregate Material Wasta Ton No Bid Wasta Ton No Bid Wasta Ton No Bid
21 3/4 Inch Gravel Cushion Aggregate|

Material Wasta Ton $4.97 Wasta Ton No Bid Wasta Ton No Bid
22 3/4 Inch Gravel Surfacing

Aggregate Material Wasta Ton No Bid Wasta Ton No Bid Wasta Ton No Bid
23 Haul To 5 Miles Ton-Mile No Bid To 5 Miles Ton-Mile No Bid To 5 Miles Ton-Mile No Bid
24 Haul 5 to 15 miles Ton-Mile No Bid 5to 15 miles Ton-Mile No Bid 5to 15 miles Ton-Mile No Bid
25 Haul 15 or more miles Ton-Mile No Bid 15 or more miles Ton-Mile No Bid 15 or more miles Ton-Mile No Bid

10




2010 ANNUAL BID Hills Materials Company J & J Asphalt Company Simon Contractors of SD, Inc.
ASPHALT MAINTENANCE MATERIALS P.O. Box 2320 P.O. Box 7105 P.O. Box 397
March 8, 2010 2:00 PM Rapid City, SD 57709 Rapid City, SD 57709 Rapid City, SD 57709
(605) 394-3300 (605) 341-6262 (605) 342-3734
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION UNIT UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
1 Asphalt Concrete, Class E, Type 1 Ton $55.20 $57.50 $52.50
2 Asphalt Concrete, Class E, Type 2 Ton $58.40 $59.50 $56.50
3 Asphalt Concrete, Class S Ton $69.00 No Bid $75.00
4 Cold Mix Maintenance Mixture Ton $63.00 No Bid $70.00

11



2010 ANNUAL BID
COMPOSITE ASPHALT CONCRETE
March 8, 2010 2:00 PM

Hills Materials Company
P.O. Box 2320

Rapid City, SD 57709
(605) 394-3300

J & J Asphalt Company
P.O. Box 7105

Rapid City, SD 57709
(605) 341-6262

Simon Contractors of SD, Inc.
P.O. Box 397

Rapid City, SD 57709

(605) 342-3734

ITEM
NO. DESCRIPTION UNIT UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
1 |Mobilization Project $5,300.00 $2,500.00 $2,800.00
2 |Tack Coat (SS-1H/CSS-1H) Ton $1,500.00 $1,200.00 $1,250.00
3 |Prime Coat (MC-70) Ton $985.00 $1,200.00 $1,250.00
4 |Blotting Sand Ton $125.00 $75.00 $85.00
5 |Asphalt Concrete (Class E, Type 1) Ton $75.00 $71.00 $71.00
6 |Asphalt Concrete (Class E, Type 2) Ton $81.00 $73.00 $75.00
7 |Haul Ton-Mile $0.50 $0.30 $0.35
8 Per 1,000 Tons
Traffic Control/Signage Asphalt Concrete $1,200.00 $1,000.00 $1,100.00
9 Per 1,000 Tons
Pilot Car Asphalt Concrete $760.00 $500.00 $750.00
Per 1,000 Tons
10 |Flagging Asphalt Concrete $870.00 $850.00 $950.00

12




2010 ANNUAL BID
CONCRETE PRODUCTS
March 8, 2010 2:00 PM

A sample of bids received follows.
The entire proposal furnished by the supplier is available for review.

Cretex Concrete Products West, Inc.
P.O. Box 1620

Rapid City, SD 57709

(605) 718-4111

ITEM UNIT | UNIT PRICE ITEM UNIT | UNIT PRICE
18" CL3 ROUND LF $16.32 6' X 6' BOX CULVERT LF $319.00
18" CL3 ROUND END SECTION EACH $325.72 6' X 6' BOX CULVERT END SECTION EACH $3,381.00
24" CL3 ROUND LF $22.65 8' X 8 BOX CULVERT LF $401.00
24" CL3 ROUND END SECTION EACH $362.04 8' X 8' BOX CULVERT END SECTION EACH $5,873.00
48" CL2 ROUND LF $82.25 10' X 10' BOX CULVERT LF $480.00
48" CL2 ROUND END SECTION EACH $865.37 10' X 10' BOX CULVERT END SECTION EACH $7,882.00
72" CL2 ROUND LF $177.96 12' X 12' BOX CULVERT LF $630.00
72" CL2 ROUND END SECTION EACH $1,487.61 12' X 12' BOX CULVERT END SECTION EACH] $11,550.00
96" CL2 ROUND LF $290.10 14' X 14' BOX CULVERT LF $786.00
96" CL2 ROUND END SECTION EACH $3,599.58 14' X 14' BOX CULVERT END SECTION EACH] $17,289.00
108" CL2 ROUND LF $434.54 DBL 7' X 7' BOX CULVERT LF $604.00
108" CL2 ROUND END SECTION EACH $6,081.64 DBL 7' X 77 BOX CULVERT END SECTION EACH $7,332.00
18" CL3 ARCH LF $30.05 DBL 8' X 8 BOX CULVERT LF $667.00
18" CL3 ARCH END SECTION EACH $295.89 DBL 8' X 8 BOX CULVERT END SECTION EACH $9,655.00
24" CL3 ARCH LF $45.12 DBL 10' X 10' BOX CULVERT LF $812.00
24" CL3 ARCH END SECTION EACH $349.50 DBL 10' X 10' BOX CULVERT END SECTION EACH] $13,062.00
48" CL2 ARCH LF $106.82 DBL 12' X 12' BOX CULVERT LF $969.00
48" CL2 ARCH END SECTION EACH $960.45 DBL 12' X 12' BOX CULVERT END SECTION EACH] $17,455.00
72" CL2 ARCH LF $218.08 DBL 14' X 14' BOX CULVERT LF $1,243.00
72" CL2 ARCH END SECTION EACH $1,803.17 DBL 14' X 14' BOX CULVERT END SECTION EACH] $26,988.00
PRESTRESSED ABUTMENT PLANK 4" X 22" LF $25.00 23" X 3'10" DBL "T" 20' EACH $1,978.00

23" X 3'10" DBL "T" 40' EACH $3,539.00

30" X 3'10" DBL "T" 20' EACH $2,191.00

30" X 3'10" DBL "T" 40' EACH $3,829.00

30" X 3'10" DBL "T" 60' EACH $5,985.00

40" X 6'6" BULB "T" 70' EACH] $11,403.00

40" X 6'6" BULB "T" 80' EACH] $12,983.00

40" X 6'6" BULB "T" 99' EACH] $16,375.00
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2010 ANNUAL BID

CORRUGATED METAL PIPE

March 8, 2010 2:00 PM

Huron Culvert & Tank Co.

Huron Culvert & Tank Co.

22/3X1/2 P.O. Box 1439 5x1 P.O. Box 1439
Corrugations Huron, SD 57350 Corrugations Huron, SD 57350
(Round) (605) 352-8643 (Round) (605) 352-8643
UNIT |UNIT PRICE 24"| UNIT PRICE UNIT |UNIT PRICE 24"
GAUGE/ PRICE ANNULAR 16" DIMPLE SIZE GAUGE/ PRICE ANNULAR
SIZE (DIA)] THICKNESS | /FT BAND (EACH) BAND (DIA) | THICKNESS /FT BAND (EACH)
12" 16/.064" $7.23 $14.46 $14.46 60" 12/.109" $62.49 $124.98
15" 16/.064" $9.13 $18.26 $18.26 72" 12/.109" $75.49 $150.98
18" 16/.064" $10.85 $21.70 $21.70 84" 12/.109" $87.67 $175.34
21" 16/.064" $12.56 $25.12 $25.12 96" 12/.109" $99.84 $199.68
24" 16/.064" $14.48 $28.96 $28.96 108" 12/.109" $112.81 $225.62
30" 16/.064" $17.72 $35.44 $35.44 120" 12/.109" $124.98 $249.96
24" 14/.079" $17.78 $35.56 $35.56 60" 10/.138" $80.35 $160.70
30" 14/.079" $21.78 $43.56 $43.56 72" 10/.138" $95.78 $191.56
36" 14/.079" $26.02 $52.04 $52.04 84" 10/.138" $111.08 $222.16
36" 12/.109" $35.98 $71.96 $71.96 96" 10/.138" $127.42 $254.84
42" 12/.109" $42.13 $84.26 $84.26 108" 10/.138" $143.65 $287.30
48" 12/.109" $47.96 $95.92 $95.92 120" 10/.138" $159.10 $318.20
132" 10/.138" $175.33 $350.66
144" 10/.138" $190.74 $381.48
Huron Culvert & Tank Co. Huron Culvert & Tank Co.
22/3X1/2 P.O. Box 1439 5x1 P.O. Box 1439
Corrugations Huron, SD 57350 Corrugations Huron, SD 57350
(Arch) (605) 352-8643 (Arch) (605) 352-8643
UNIT |UNIT PRICE 24"| UNIT PRICE UNIT |UNIT PRICE 24"
GAUGE/ PRICE ANNULAR 16" DIMPLE SIZE GAUGE/ PRICE ANNULAR
SIZE (DIA)] THICKNESS | /FT BAND (EACH) BAND (DIA) | THICKNESS /FT BAND (EACH)
15" 16/.064" $10.01 $20.02 $20.02 48" 14/.079" $38.03 $76.06
18" 16/.064" $11.84 $23.68 $23.68 60" 14/.079" $48.71 $97.42
24" 16/.064" $15.57 $31.14 $31.14 72" 14/.079" $58.89 $117.78
30" 16/.064" $19.03 $38.06 $38.06 84" 12/.109" $93.37 $186.74
30" 14/.079" $23.09 $46.18 $46.18 96" 12/.109" $106.67 $213.34
36" 14/.079" $27.33 $54.66 $54.66 108" 12/.109" $120.79 $241.58
36" 12/.109" $37.29 $74.58 $74.58 120" 12/.109" $134.10 $268.20
42" 12/.109" $43.66 $87.32 $87.32 60" 10/.138" $83.76 $167.52
48" 12/.109" $49.71 $99.42 $99.42 72" 10/.138" $100.35 $200.70
84" 10/.138" $116.78 $233.56
96" 10/.138" $134.27 $268.54
108" 10/.138" $151.63 $303.26
120" 10/.138" $168.22 $336.44
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2010 ANNUAL BID
CUTBACK AND EMULSIFIED ASPHALT
March 8, 2010 2:00 PM

Hills Materials Company
P.O. Box 2320

Rapid City, SD 57709
(605) 394-3300

J & J Asphalt Company
P.O. Box 7105

Rapid City, SD 57709
(605) 341-6262

FULL TRANSPORT LOAD

AREA DELIVERY

FULL TRANSPORT LOAD
AREA DELIVERY

ITEM FREIGHT PREPAID LOCAL PICKUP BY FREIGHT PREPAID LOCAL PICKUP BY
NO. DESCRIPTION DESIGNATION PRICE/TON COUNTY PRICE/TON PRICE/TON COUNTY PRICE/TON

1 [MC70 Rapid City $852.00 $892.00 $820.00 $880.00

2 [MC800 Rapid City No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

3 [MC3000 Rapid City No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

4 |MC3000R Rapid City No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

5 |[AE150 Rapid City No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

6 |AE150S Rapid City $547.00 $588.00 No Bid No Bid

7 |AE150L Rapid City $582.00 $639.00 No Bid No Bid

8 |AE200 Rapid City $630.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

9 |[AE300 Rapid City No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

10 |CRS-1 Rapid City No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

11 |CSS-1H Rapid City $566.00 $607.00 No Bid No Bid

12 |RS-1 Rapid City No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

13 |SS-1H Rapid City $566.00 $607.00 No Bid No Bid

14 |Unloading Damage Charge /Hour $220.00 No Bid
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2010 ANNUAL BID
EQUIPMENT RENTAL
March 8, 2010 2:00 PM

Motion to award Equipment Rental to Butler Machinery
Company, Jenner Equipment Company, and Sheehan Mack
Sales and Equipment, based upon availability of equipment.

16



2010 ANNUAL BID
FENCING
March 8, 2010 2:00 PM

M & M Fencing

714 Northridge Dr.
Rapid City, SD 57701
(605) 391-4426

CONTRACTOR COUNTY
FURNISHED FURNISHED
MATERIALS MATERIALS
ITEM
NO. DESCRIPTION UNITS UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
1 |Barbed Wire Fence 3-Strand LF $0.67 $0.52
2 |Barbed Wire Fence 4-Strand LF $0.72 $0.54
3 |Type 4 Woven Fence LF $1.45 $0.85
4 |Brace Panels (2 post) Each $75.00 $60.00
5 |Brace Panels (3 post) Each $95.00 $80.00
6 |Wire Gate Each $30.00 $25.00
7 |Tubular Frame Gates Each $185.00 $50.00
8 |4" Dia. Wooden Fence Posts Each $8.75 $3.75
9 [Steel Fence Posts Each $7.75 $3.25
10 |Temporary Fence LF $0.95 $0.80
11 |Take Out Fence LF $0.25 $0.25
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2010 ANNUAL BID J.H. Hilt Engineering, Inc.
GUARDRAIL P.O. Box 9338
March 8, 2010 2:00 PM Rapid City, SD 57709
(605) 787-4111
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION UNIT UNIT PRICE
1 Furnish and Install Three Cable Guardrail LF $11.00
2 Furnish and Install Three Cable Guardrail Slip Base Anchor Section Each $1,600.00
3 Furnish and Construct Steel W Beam Guardrail LF $22.50
4 Furnish and Construct Steel W Beam Flared End Terminal Each $2,500.00
5 Furnish and Construct Steel W Beam Tangent End Terminal Each $3,000.00
6 Construct Steel W Beam Guardrail Salvaged Materials LF $15.00
7 Construct Steel W Beam Breakaway End Anchorage Salvaged Materials Each $750.00
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2010 ANNUAL BID
MAGNESIUM CHLORIDE SOLUTION
March 8, 2010 2:00 PM

Z & S Dust Control System
22470 Bennett Rd.

Rapid City, SD 57701
(605) 341-1440

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION PRICE PER GALLON
1 Magnesium Chloride, for Ice Control, FOB
County Yard, Rapid City, SD $1.27
5 Magnesium Chloride, FOB Any point in
Pennington County $0.71
Magnesium Chloride Application Any
3 point in Pennington County $0.05
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2010 ANNUAL BID
SEEDING, FERTILIZING, MULCHING, & EROSION CONTROL BLANKET
March 8, 2010 2:00 PM

J.H. Hilt Engineering, Inc.
P.O. Box 9338

Rapid City, SD 57709
(605) 787-4111

M & M Fencing

714 Northridge Drive
Rapid City, SD 57701
(605) 391-4426

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION UNIT UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

Seedbed Preparation and Seeding Acre $395.00 $135.00
2 Seeding Only Acre $295.00 $85.00
3 Furnish & Install Fertilizer Ton $1,100.00 $1,150.00
4 Furnish and Install Grass, Hay, or Straw Mulch Ton $200.00 $250.00
5 Furnish and Install Fiber Mulch Ton $1,700.00 No Bid
6 Furnish and Install Type 2 Erosion Control Blanket SY $2.00 $3.50
7 Furnish and Install Type 2 Turf Reinforcement Mat Sy $6.00 $4.35
8 Furnish and Install 12" Erosion Control Wattle FT $7.50 $7.50
9 Furnish and Install High Velocity Erosion Control Silt Fence FT $4.00 $4.10
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2010 ANNUAL BID
TIMBER BRIDGE MATERIALS
March 8, 2010 2:00 PM

Wheeler Lumber, LLC
P.O. Box 8
Whitewood, SD 57793
(605) 269-2215

Dimensions Price/Piece
TIMBER STRINGERS TREATED DOUGLAS FIR- WESTERN
LARCH (Dense No. 1 or Better:)
6" X 16" X 16' $217.60
6" X 16" X 20’ $272.00
8" X 20" X 16' $362.67
8" X 20" X 20 $453.33
8" X 20" X 26' $624.00
TIMBER CAPS TREATED DOUGLAS FIR-WESTERN LARCH
(Dense No. 1 or Better):
12" X 12" X 24' $423.36
12" X 12" X 28' $510.72
12" X 12" X 32' $602.88
BRIDGE PLANK TREATED DOUGLAS FIR-WESTERN LARCH
(Commercial Grade or Better):
3"X12"X 18 $73.98
3" X 12" X 20' $82.20
3" X 12" X 24' $102.24
3" X 12" X 26' $114.66
PILING:
25' $362.50
30 $435.00
35' $507.50
40' $580.00
45' $652.50
HARDWARE:
Item

Nuts, Bolts, Washers

$3.00 per pound
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2010 ANNUAL BID
TRAFFIC CONTROL MATERIALS
March 8, 2010 2:00 PM

Lyle Signs, Inc.
115 17th St. SW

Jamestown, ND 58401
(877) 895-8816 Ext. 10

MUTCD STANDARD SIGNS
Price Per Square Foot

25 Signs & Up +
Aluminum Sign Blanks (Thickness) 1-9 Signs 10 - 24 Signs | 25 Signs & Up | In Excess of
1,000 Ibs.
0.080" $3.28 $3.04 $2.95 $2.48
0.100" $4.03 $3.73 $3.62 $3.05
Aluminum Sign Blanks with ASTM D4956-04 Type IlII* "High Intensity"
Sign Face (Thickness)
0.080" $5.53 $5.10 $4.94 $4.33
0.100" $6.28 $5.79 $5.18 $4.81
Aluminum Signs with ASTM D4956-04 Type VII "Super High Intensity"
Sign Face (Thickness)
0.080" $9.45 $8.68 $8.39 $7.67
0.100" $10.19 $9.37 $9.06 $8.14
Aluminum Signs with ASTM D4956-04 Type IlI* "High Intensity" Sign
Face and covered with Anti-Vandal Clear Overlay Protective Film (3M
Product 1150 or Equivalent) (Thickness)
0.080" $7.31 $6.73 $6.50 $5.80
0.100" $8.06 $7.42 $7.18 $6.37
Aluminum Signs with ASTM D4956-04 Type VII "Super High Intensity"
Sign Face and covered with Anti-Vandal Clear Overlay Protective Film
(3M Product 1150 or Equivalent) (Thickness)
0.080" $9.85 $9.05 $8.74 $7.94
0.100" $10.59 $9.74 $9.41 $8.51
Street Name Signs, Aluminum Variable length and 9" Wide, Blanks with
4 holes and ASTM D4956-04 Type III* "High Intensity" White Sheeting -
No Message (Thickness)
0.080" $5.63 $5.19 $5.02 $4.52
Street Name Signs, Aluminum Variable length and 9" Wide, Blanks with
4 holes and ASTM D4956-04 Type VIl "Super High Intensity" White
Sheeting - No Message (Thickness)
0.080" $9.54 $8.77 $8.47 $7.86

*Type Il Beaded Sheeting should not be used for white-on-green signs.
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